County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Phone: 315-785-30; Fax: 315-785-7591

<u>Buyers</u> Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u>

Mark Sachetti

NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

November 1, 2021

ATTN ADAM HUNGERFORD EQUIPMENT RENTALS INC 23150 NYS RT 12 WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2021F-8

NAME: GROUNDSKEEPING AND SMALL ENGINE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND SUPPLIES - KOHLER, SHINDAIWA AND STIHL PARTS

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Hungerford:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

√ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Walldroff Farm Equipment

Shared/Purchasing/Bids/Bid Book Fleet Related/Groundskeeping and Small Equipment Replacement Parts and Supplies 2021F-8/Award 2021F-8 Equipment Rental

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565

Phone: 315-785-3077 Fax: 315-785-7591

<u>Buyers</u> Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u>

Mark Sachetti

NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

November 1, 2021

ATTN DAVID SCHRYUER
WALLDROFF FARM EQUIPMENT INC
22537 COUNTY ROUTE 51
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2021F-8

NAME: GROUNDSKEEPING AND SMALL ENGINE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENTS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - KUBOTA PARTS

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Schryuer:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

V Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Equipment Rentals

BID #2021F-8 GROUNDSKEEPING AND SMALL ENGINE EQUIPMENT PARTS SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

		EQUIPMENT RENTALS INC				WALLDROFF FARM EQUIP INC			
		FOR THE PERIOD. 11/1/21 - 10/31/22		FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/31/23		FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/21 - 10/31/22		FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	
MANUFACTURER	ANNUAL PARTS/SUPPLIES ESTIMATED DOLLARS	% DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED RETAIL LIST	= DISCOUNT PRICE	% DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED RETAIL LIST	= DISCOUNT PRICE	% DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED RETAIL LIST	= DISCOUNT PRICE	% DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED RETAIL LIST	= DISCOUN PRICE
Agri-Fab Parts	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Ariens Parts	\$500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Bolen Parts	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID.	NO BID	NO BID
Briggs Stratton	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BÍD	NO BID
Gravely Parts	\$500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Homelite Parts	\$500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Honda Parts	\$1,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Jonsered Parts	\$500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
John Deere Parts	\$700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kohler	\$100.00	0%	\$100.00	237 0%	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kubota Kubota	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0%	\$100,00	0%	\$100.00
Lombardini	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Shindaiwa Parts	\$250.00	0%	\$250.00	0%	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Simplicity Parts	\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Snapper Parts	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Stihl Parts	\$1,600.00	0%	\$1,600.00	0%	\$1,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tecumseh	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Troy- Bilt Parts	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

On-Line Ordering Available:

NO-

NO

WARRANTY:

COMMENTS:

Both Equipment Rentals and Walldroff bid same pricing for Kohler. Names drawn, Walldroff Farm Equipment was chosen.

DEVIATIONS:

NO

NO

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.

THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

PURCHASING

10/21/2021 DATE